	(631)
	SERIAL C6355


Storemen and Packers, Wholesale Paint, Varnish and Colour Stores (State) Award

INDUSTRIAL RELATIONS COMMISSION OF NEW SOUTH WALES

Review of Award pursuant to Section 19 of the Industrial Relations Act 1996.

(No. IRC 1729 of 2007)

	Before Commissioner Stanton
	30 November 2007


REVIEWED AWARD
1.
Delete the words "paint an/or colour" in subclause (i) of clause 2, Definitions, of the award published 14 December 2001 (330 I.G. 327), and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"paint and/or colour"

2.
Delete the words "be allowed shift workers" in paragraph (b) of subclause (ii) of clause 3, Hours, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"be allowed to shift workers"

3.
Delete the words "two day's pay" in subclause (iii) of clause 6, Payment of Wages, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"two days' pay"

4.
Delete the words "such advise shall be" in subclause (v) of clause 6A. Deduction and Remittance of Union Membership Fees, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"such advice shall be"

5.
Delete the words "four hour's pay" in subclause (iv) of clause 7, Overtime, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"four hours' pay"

6.
Delete paragraph (a) of subclause (ii) of clause 13, Annual Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

(a)
In addition to the leave prescribed by the Annual Holidays Act 1944, a further period of seven days' leave with 40 hours' pay at ordinary rates shall be allowed annually to employees after not less than 12 months' continuous service as seven day shift workers under this Award, less the period of Annual Leave.

7.
Delete the words "12 month's continuous service" in paragraph (b) of subclause (ii) of clause 13, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"12 months' continuous service"

8.
Delete the words "doctor certificate" in subclause (ii) of clause 16, Sick Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"doctor's certificate"

9.
Delete the words "three month's continuous service" in subclause (iii) of clause 16, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"three months' continuous service"

10.
Delete the words "two years continuous service" in subparagraph (2) of paragraph (a) of subclause (iv) of clause 17, Redundancy, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"two years' continuous service"

11.
Delete the words "3 months notice" in subparagraph (1) of paragraph (b) of subclause (iv) of clause 17, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"3 months' notice"

12.
Delete the words "employers agreement" in paragraph (d) of subclause 3, Annual Leave, of clause 18, State Personal/Carer's Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"employer's agreement"

13.
Delete the words "two days bereavement leave" in subclause (a) of clause 23, Bereavement Leave, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"two days' bereavement leave"

14.
Delete subclauses (d) and (e) of clause 26, Area, Incidence and Duration, and insert in lieu thereof the following:

(d)
The changes made to the award pursuant to the Award Review pursuant to section 19(6) of the Industrial Relations Act 1996 and Principle 26 of the Principles for Review of Awards made by the Industrial Relations Commission of New South Wales on 28 April 1999 (310 I.G. 359) take effect on and from 30 November 2007.

(e)
This award remains in force until varied or rescinded, the period for which it was made already having expired.

J.D. STANTON, Commissioner

____________________

Printed by the authority of the Industrial Registrar.
PAGE  
- 2 -


